
Heritage Lottery Fund 
Schedule of Decisions under delegated powers to Head of HLF North East on 27th April 2017 

Sharing Heritage 
Item Project Title  Project Description  Applicant Decision  

1. Repairs to historic wooden 
boatshed roof 

This project is for a small 
programme of capital works 
only, to repair the roof of a 
Victorian boat shed. 

North East Maritime Trust Reject 

2. Mauretania Day 

This four month project 
focuses on the delivery of a 
'Mauretania Day' event, 
celebrating how Amble got its 
nickname 'the last and 
kindliest port in England.’ 

Amble Development Trust Reject 

3. Where The Waters Meet 

This project will explore the 
natural heritage of the Till 
Valley, through engaging local 
people and visitors to the area 
in a range heritage activities 

Glendale Gateway Trust Award Grant of £9,000 (70%) 

Our Heritage 
Item Project Title  Project Description Applicant Decision 

4. Lindisfarne: Etched in Stone 
Digventures seek an award for 
a participatory archaeological 
dig to uncover evidence of 
Lindisfarne's renowned 

DigVentures Reject 
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Medieval monastery 

5. Arbeia: Our Fort, Our 
Heritage 

This 16 month project aims to 
regenerate Arbeia Roman 
Fort.  It will raise the profile of 
the Fort as well as improve its 
facilities, increasing the appeal 
and footfall of the Fort 

Tyne & Wear Archives & 
Museums Award Grant of £71,800 (25%) 

Young Roots 

First World War 

Item Project Title  Project Description  Applicant Decision  

6. When Yesterday was Young 

The project will engage 80 
young people with the history 
of coalmining in the North 
East, with a particular focus on 
the Colliery that was located in 
the town where they live. 

Enter CIC Award Grant of £49,900 (100%) 

Item Project Title  Project Description Applicant Decision 

7. Rainbird - A Painter's 
Tragedy 

The project aims to carry out 
research and then create a 
stage play focused on the life 
and war experiences of the 
North Shields artist, Victor 
Noble Rainbird 

Cloud Nine Theatre 
Productions Award Grant £9,900 (21%) 
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Resilient Heritage 
Item Project Title  Project Description Applicant Decision 

9. Guisborough Town Hall 
Gateway Project 

Guisborough Town Hall 
Gateway Project seek to 
develop themselves as an 
organisation and investigate 
further the heritage and 
proposals for the future 
sustainable use of the Grade II 
Listed Town Hall. 

Guisborough Town Hall 
Gateway Project Award Grant of £10,000 (100%) 

10. The Reclaimed Lands 

Reclaimed Lands will address 
the need to conserve, enhance 
and celebrate the 200 year 
cultural, natural and industrial 
heritage of South East 
Northumberland that resulted 
from its nationally significant 
coal mining past 

Groundwork NE Award Grant of £9,500 (100%) 

 

8. 

"Aftermath" - how the war 
affected returning 
servicemen and their 
families. 

This four month project aims to 
use the regimental archive to 
research the experiences of 
returning servicemen from the 
Western Front in 1918-19 to 
get a picture of the difficulties 
both they and their families 
faced caused by the conflict. 

The King's Own Scottish 
Borderers Regimental 
Association 

Award Grant of £10,000 (100%) 
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